COLORADO COUNTY BIDS FOR WEED AND BRUSH CONTROL

OPENED PUBLICLY MARCH 2, 2023
FOR THE PERIOD APRIL 1, 2023 TO MARCH 31, 2024

€)) Herbicide, “Round-Up Pro”, or proven equal
2-1/2 Gallons 30 Gallons
Del. Picked Up Del. Picked Up

Nutrien Ag Solutions | 47.25 47.25 567.00 567.00
(Territory Mgr)
Nutrien Ag Solutions | 57.50 No Bid 690.00 No Bid
(VM Sales)
Nutrien Ag Solutions | 25.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
(crop consultant
(Wharton)
Site One Landscaping | 110.00 110.00 Pick up in Katy 1281.11 1281.11
Helena Ag No Bid 45.11/gal | Pick up in Garwood No Bid No Bid
Pickup Location

2) Arsenal, or proven equal

1 Quart 2-1/2 Gallons 15 Gallons
Del. Picked Up | Del. Picked up | Del. Picked Up

Nutrien Ag Solutions 31.50 31.50 191.75 191.75 1180.50 1180.50
(Territory Mgr)

Nutrien Ag Solutions No Bid No Bid 200.00 No Bid 1200.00 No Bid
(VM Sales)

Nutrien Ag Solutions

(crop consultant No Bid No Bid 75.00/gal | No Bid No Bid No Bid
(Wharton)

Site One Landscaping o Bid No Bid 587.74 587.74 No Bid No Bid
Helena Ag o Bid No Bid No Bid 72.00/gal | No Bid No Bid

Pickup Location

Site one — Katy Helena - Garwood

3) Herbicide, Pramital, or proven equal
1 Gallon 2-1/2 Gallons Plant
Del. Picked Up | Del. Picked up Location
Nutrien Ag Solutions 36.00 36.00 82.50 82.50
(Territory Mgr)
Nutrien Ag Solutions No Bid No Bid 97.50 No Bid
(VM Sales)
Nutrien Ag Solutions|
(crop consultant 37.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
(Wharton)
Site One Landscaping O BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Helena Ag O BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Pickup Location
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